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From: Craig Nicholson < @gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 9:00 am
To:
Cc: Lonnie Dalzell; Greg Lee; 
Subject: Re: Te Ahu a Turanga - Tolling Assessment

Hi  
 
Thanks for confirming you don't need anything else. It would be good to hear the outcome after Thursday. 
 
Lonnie - I will generate a final invoice in the next few days... I'll use the correct WBS this time! It will only cover a few 
hours I spent liaising with Sam about the analysis (while he was pulling together the paper) and revising the analysis 
spreadsheet to include some extra information he wanted about the split of light and heavy vehicles on Saddle 
Road. 
 
Kind regards, 
 
Craig 
 
On Mon, Mar 16, 2020 at 8:04 AM @nzta.govt.nz> wrote: 

Hi Craig 

No – we’re good. I’ll be able to let you know the outcome on Thursday, after the Board meeting. 

We really appreciate the work you put in. 

Cheers 

 

From: Lonnie Dalzell <Lonnie.Dalzell@nzta.govt.nz>  
Sent: Saturday, 14 March 2020 9:36 AM 
To: Craig Nicholson < @gmail.com> 
Cc: Greg Lee <Greg.Lee2@nzta.govt.nz>; @nzta.govt.nz>;  

@nzta.govt.nz> 
Subject: Re: Te Ahu a Turanga - Tolling Assessment 

Kia ora Craig, 

I think Sam is away, however I met with him and  a few weeks ago and they were finalising the 
recommendation for the board, so my guess is that at stage nothing is required. 

Thanks for following up. 

Ngā mihi nui 

Lonnie 
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