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Schedule 10:  Completion Requirements 

General 

1. Independent Reviewer Actions 

The following are descriptions of the Independent Reviewer Actions utilised in the following 
tables to describe the extent of the actions the Independent Review is required to take in 
relation to the testing of each element.   

1.1 Independent Review Action 1 

Independent Reviewer receives (whether electronically or physically, at the option of the 
Contractor) all Contractor records (e.g., drawings (Final Design Documentation, plans, QA 
records, test results, Producer Statements, other certifications received by the Contractor 
from 3rd parties), then reviews a representative sample to confirm they are complete, 
appropriate and are in accordance with applicable Project Agreement requirements.  The 
Independent Reviewer does not verify design.    

That is, through representative sampling, audits and physical inspection (as required by the 
relevant Milestone test, Works Completion Test or Close-out Test), the Independent 
Reviewer is required to confirm the as-built works: 

• are of appropriate quality, by reference to the Project Agreement requirements;  

• are in accordance with the Final Design Documentation, or any changes to the Final 
Design Documentation are appropriately addressed (e.g., design changes due to 
encountered site conditions); 

• (once the as-built documentation is received) are in accordance with the as-built 
documentation; and 

• tests have been satisfactorily completed in line with the Finalised ITPs, such that any 
anomalies in test results or approach are satisfactorily addressed and closed-out, 
including via re-test or alternative testing, as appropriate and as in line with Action 2 
below. 

In undertaking the above, the Independent Reviewer is not required to confirm that the 
Finalised Design Documentation complies with the Works Requirements. 

1.2 Independent Review Action 2 

Independent Reviewer receives evidence of transmittal of Contractor documentation to the 
Transport Agency. 

1.3 Independent Review Action 3 

Independent Reviewer attends and witnesses a representative sample of tests undertaken 
by the Contractor.  Testing will be in accordance with the Finalised ITPs.  With the exception 
of any testing identified for completion by the Independent Reviewer within Schedule 10, the 
Independent Reviewer is not required to undertake its own testing, however it retains the 
right: 

(a) to require that the Contractor undertakes re-tests where:  
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